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Subject: Intimation under Regulation 30 read with Schedule III of the Securities and Exchange Board of 

India ("SEBI") (Listing Obligations and Disclosure Requirements) Regulations, 2015 (“SEBI Listing 

Regulations”) Press Release – “Smartworks launches ‘SmartVantage’ to power the next phase of Global 

Capability Center (GCCs) growth in India”. 

 

Dear Sir/Ma’am, 

 

Please find enclosed a copy of Press Release intimation under Regulation 30 read with Schedule III of the 

Securities and Exchange Board of India ("SEBI") (Listing Obligations and Disclosure Requirements) 

Regulations, 2015 (“SEBI Listing Regulations”) titled “Smartworks launches ‘SmartVantage’ to power the 

next phase of Global Capability Center (GCC) growth in India”. 
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https://www.smartworksoffice.com/investors/ 
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Smartworks launches ‘SmartVantage’ to power the next phase of Global Capability 
Center (GCC) growth in India 

Gurugram, September 29, 2025: Smartworks Coworking Spaces Limited (“Smartworks”), India’s largest 
managed office platform by area under management, today announced the launch of SmartVantage — a 
purpose-built solution designed to accelerate the next phase of growth for Global Capability Centers 
(GCCs) in India. 

SmartVantage combines expansive campuses, a consultative approach to help GCCs build offices suited 
to their needs, and a curated partner ecosystem — enabling GCCs to scale rapidly and sustainably while 
maintaining cost efficiency. By going beyond traditional workspace solutions, the offering delivers large-
format, whole-building campuses — many spanning over 500,000 sq. ft. — that can be tailored to reflect 
the unique identity of GCCs. 

Leveraging Smartworks’ ~12 million sq. ft. portfolio across 14 cities in India and Singapore, 
SmartVantage provides GCCs with multi-city continuity and faster time-to-go-live, supported by 
Smartworks’ execution playbook—offices in campuses typically delivered in 60 days. This is further 
strengthened by a curated partner network that offers support in areas such as legal, compliance, taxation, 
workforce, and innovation — helping GCCs enhance operational resilience, foster innovation, and unlock 
long-term strategic value from their India operations. 

Commenting on SmartVantage, Neetish Sarda, Founder & Managing Director, Smartworks said: 

“At Smartworks, we’ve always focused on creating campuses where people genuinely want to come to 
work. Our large-format spaces, with aspirational amenities, help enterprises attract and retain top talent — 
something we’ve learnt by serving over 100,000 members who walk into our campuses every day. For 
GCCs, flexibility is critical — they need quick turnaround spaces with the ability to expand seamlessly as 
they grow, and our pan-India presence, speed to office delivery within 60 days and robust portfolio make 
that possible.  

With SmartVantage, we are building on this strength by bringing in curated alliance partners who can 
support GCCs with legal and compliance requirements, taxation, talent acquisition, operational advisory, 
and even R&D and innovation. Through these partners, Smartworks is now able to offer services across 
the spectrum, creating an ecosystem for GCC success in India." 

Smartworks currently serves over 730 clients, including GCCs, Forbes Global 2000 companies and large 
enterprises such as Google, EY, Persistent, Xoriant, and Discovery. Its campuses are designed to 
strengthen employee engagement and retention, offering modern amenities such as cafés, gyms, indoor 
and outdoor recreational zones, childcare facilities, and wellness zones. 

With the launch of SmartVantage, Smartworks reinforces its role as a category leader in the managed office 
segment — offering enterprises not just real estate, but an integrated ecosystem that supports growth, 
innovation, and long-term value creation. 

 

 



 
About Smartworks Coworking Spaces Limited    

Smartworks Coworking Spaces Ltd (‘Smartworks’) is the largest managed office platform by total area under 
management ~12 mn sq. ft across 14 cities in India and Singapore. The company serves as a one-stop 
workspace solution for companies. The company leases entire/large bare shell properties in prime locations 
from landlords and transforms them into fully serviced, ‘Smartworks’ branded, and tech-enabled Campuses 
with daily-life and aspirational amenities —cafeterias, sports zones, convenience stores, gyms, crèches, 
and medical centres.      

Smartworks focusses on mid-to-large Enterprises and has a diverse client base of over 730 Clients, which 
includes Forbes 2000 companies, corporates, MNCs and startups.    

Safe Harbour   

This press release (the “Release”), prepared by Smartworks Coworking Spaces Limited (the “Company”), 
is furnished solely for informational purposes and shall not constitute, or be relied upon in connection with, 
any offer, solicitation, or invitation to subscribe for or purchase any securities of the Company. No securities 
of the Company will be offered except by means of a statutory offering document that contains detailed 
information about the Company.   

The information and data contained herein have been compiled from sources the Company believes to be 
reliable; however, the Company makes no representation or warranty, express or implied, as to the 
accuracy, completeness, or fairness of such information. This Release is not intended to be all-inclusive, 
and readers should not rely solely on the information contained herein. The Company expressly disclaims 
any liability for any loss arising from, or in reliance upon, the whole or any part of the contents of this 
Release.   

This Release may include forward-looking statements regarding, among other things, the Company’s 
financial performance, growth prospects, strategy, and market opportunities. These statements involve 
known and unknown risks, uncertainties, and other factors such as macro-economic conditions, competitive 
pressures, regulatory changes, technological developments, and execution challenges that could cause 
actual results, performance, or achievements to differ materially from those expressed or implied herein. 
The Company undertakes no obligation to update or revise any forward-looking statements, whether as a 
result of new information, future events, or otherwise, except as required by applicable law. Any forward-
looking statements or projections attributed to third parties contained in this Release are not endorsed by 
the Company, which accepts no responsibility for such third-party information.  

 

For more information, pl contact: 

Anita Sharma  
 
PR & Communication 
Anita.sharma@sworks.co.in  
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